From: Heather Bleemers <heather.bleemers@lacity.org>

Sent time: 08/24/2018 09:50:35 AM

To: Riva Martin <bettertc@aol.com>
Subject: Re: 1760 N VINE ST./ENV2018-2116
Hi Liz,

Thank you for the update! I appreciate all of your work on this order.
Have a great weekend!

- Heather

Heather Bleemers

Senior City Planner

Department of City Planning

T: (213) 847-3682

221 N. Figueroa Street, 13th Floor
Los Angeles, CA 90012

fiG)v]jo

On Thu, Aug 23, 2018 at 5:55 PM, <bettertc(@aol.com> wrote:
Hello Heather,

We completed and mailed the first part of above subject. We will have second part completed tomorrow (Friday, 8/24).
Have a lovely week end!

Liz

From: Heather Bleemers <Heather.Bleemers@Iacity.org>
To: Riva Martin <bettertc@aol.com>

Sent: Tue, Aug 21, 2018 4:09 pm

Subject: Re: 1760 N VINE ST./ENV2018-2116

No special order for the 11 pages.

On Tue, Aug 21, 2018, 4:04 PM <bettertc@aol.com> wrote:
Hi Heather,

This definitely puts a different light. With the additional pages, this will require manually stuffing large envelopes and with very little
time to work we will have to work overtime to get this out by Thurs evening. Nothing will go certified. Why did the applicant wait to

will have to bill him once completed.

THX!

----- Original Message-----

From: Heather Bleemers <Heather.Bleemers@Iacity.org>
To: Riva Martin <bettertc@aol.com>

Sent: Tue, Aug 21, 2018 3:55 pm

Subject: Re: 1760 N VINE ST./ENV2018-2116

Ok, | was able to download the second document. To confirm, the 7 page and this document would need to be mailed together. Is that
what was paid for?

On Tue, Aug 21, 2018, 3:46 PM <bettertc@aol.com> wrote:
Heather - no, we do not send certified and no we are unable to open second link. Plus we have already made 200 copies of the
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7pager.

From: Heather Bleemers <Heather.Bleemers@]acity.org>
To: Riva Martin <bettertc@aol.com>

Sent: Tue, Aug 21, 2018 3:40 pm

Subject: Re: 1760 N VINE ST./ENV2018-2116

Were you able to access the dropbox file that | sent?
On Tue, Aug 21, 2018, 3:28 PM Heather Bleemers <Heather.Bleemers@lacity.org> wrote:

Is there a way to send certified? I've shared a link in a second email containing a second document that should be sent with the
first document. Sorry i'm in a meeting right now so my tech is limites

On Tue, Aug 21, 2018, 3:16 PM <bettertc@aol.com> wrote:
SORRY! The gentleman that is here filing said this has to be sent certified - we do not send pieces out certified. Pls advise just a
regular mailing and our mailing affidavit????

From: Heather Bleemers <Heather.Bleemers@lacity.org>
To: Riva Martin <bettertc@aol.com>

Sent: Tue, Aug 21, 2018 3:13 pm

Subject: Re: 1760 N VINE ST./ENV2018-2116

Hi Liz,

I'm in a meeting but the attached notice is what would need to be mailed out with regard to this case.

On Tue, Aug 21, 2018, 2:38 PM <bettertc@aol.com> wrote:
Hello Heather,

Please call our office 818-779-8866 regarding questions that we have on the above subject.
THANK U!

LIZ
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